F.No.18-68/2018-DC
Ministry of Health and Family Welfare
Directorate General of Health Services
Central Drugs Standard Control Organization

FDA Bhawan, Kotla Road, New Delhi
Date: [ F-12-201%

OFFICE MEMORANDUM

Subject: Implementation of increase in application fees for grant of various
import licences, registration certificates for Drugs and Cosmetics
and permission for import of New Drugs and Fixed Dose
Combinations under the provisions of Drugs & Cosmetics Rules,
1945-Reg.

The Drugs and Cosmetics Rules, 1945 have been amended vide
G.S.R.1193(E) dated 12.12.2018 with immediate effect to increase the application
fees for grant of various import licences, registration certificates for Drugs and
Cosmetics and permission for import of New Drugs and Fixed Dose Combinations
under the Rules.

Any application for grant of such import licences, registration certificates for
Drugs and Cosmetics and permission for import of New Drugs and Fixed Dose
Combinations as covered under the said amendment received on or after
12.12.2018 shall be accompanied by the increased fees in accordance with the
amendment.

A copy of the amendment G.S.R.1193(E) dated 12.12.2018 is enclosed.

Concerned officers in CDSCO (HQ) and its Zonal, Sub-zonal and Port offices
are directed to ensure implementation of the above amendment in the Drugs and

Cosmetics Rules, 1945 with effect from 12.12.2018.

-_—

(Dr. S. Eswara Reddy)
Drugs Controller General (India)

To
1. All Officers/staff in CDSCO(HQ)
2. All Zonal/Sub-zonal/Port offices of CDSCO
3. Guard file

Copy to
1. Indian Drugs/Pharmaceutical Association Forum
2. Website of CDSCO



T Ho o TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

The Gazette of India

STHTIRUT
EXTRAORDINARY

9T [I—EUS 3—3U-WUE (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

YRR | YehTiyTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

H. 883] =3 feeelt ggemr, feaw 12, 2018/3m@T™UT 21, 1940
No. 8831 NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 12, 2018/AGRAHAYANA 21, 1940

@y 3R TRER FeATOr WA

(ETey A qfEr FeTor fawm)

Ffer=T
T faeeft, 12 femwaw, 2018

AL.HLA. 1193(3r).—sirufer siw ymmee amft Faw, 1945 &1 3w gentes w31 % forg wfaag Faet
FT 9TEY, iufer $fiT yamas arasft sfafaam, 1940 (1940 F7 23) fit amT 12 3% o 33 F AT
AT o TSI, AT, 90 11, &< 3, 37-G< (i) 5 Feas, 2018 § AT TLH & @req 3T T
FAT HATAT (FATEST 3T TATL FHeATT (a0 if ATSg=aT . a1.%1.54. 1000(37), i@ 5 sTFeas, 2018
grer st forw o o, forme 3wt sateat &, e 39 yarfaa g 6 g g, 39 ae 9, e
3FT ATLAT Y TS it TFTT STHATETOr F IuAsy F:Ar5 W2 off, dng o A sty F s % 9,
sy i T ArmiEa B T,

ST, TSI Al TTAAT STAETET & 10 srFeas, 2018 FH ITrse &l T o,

#iY, S Wl 9% SHETETer § ured st oY gATE 9 Feaid YR g A= 7 o
T

A AT, Frald TLRE, AT ST T AT Afataaa, 1940 (1940 w1 23) F &7 12 37T &1
33 BT Yacd ATRRAT &1 TART FTd g0, U Thelenl aarghie are | THLT FA 6 79A7q Hued =i
STHTE AT ATIHAH, 1945 FT ST HTEA F3 & (o0 [Aetortaa = o g, sreriq-

1. (1) 29 R8T T a9 St S Yo Tee 9T (F9aT "gerae) e, 2018 2
(2) T TSI | I THTL T ATE Hl Tged gl

7286 G1/2018 )]



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

. STt U YHTE AT A, 1945 (S THE T8 TG S 499 gl AT ), F Haw 24 H, -
() 3u-f=m (1) ¥, -

() “TFHe SOy F 0 UF g9 T ST A/ T AT I F AT Y[R T5&1 b T T,
‘TR AT F T T g T SiY UF g AU AT & ATATIH o M5 T ST,

(i) 93GF ¥, “TF G ®IT” 9[&G1 o S| 9T U golld ®IU” 9768 TG ST,

(@) 3u-fAgw (3) ®, "I =Y AT FIQ T GIATH AT FTOAT 5@ F T U ATSHE § GO
FLIA o (10 U g1 T |1 T9Q T SFTAT AT SITOAT 77 9768 T ST |

. Sad i H, w24 5 9 ,-
(F) S9-FF== (3) # -
() ®E (i) ®, “UF A = AT AHNT STAL TeaT AT AALN o I I “TH gATT AHThT
(AT 9167 ST FEAT T ST,
(i) @< (i) 3T I TeqF |, “UF g FAHIGHT ST oreal Y Al Stgt ot o, 39 T
T T gSTTE STHTCET ST 9767 M STeM¥ 49 ST,
(@) 39-fAFw (5) ®, “UT9 g1 RN ST aeal 3fi¥ A F T UT “U=AIE g9 AT
TIAL” 9765 ST FAT T A
(M) 39- 77w (7) ®, “PT |@Y TANH ST AT 30F THIET AT FIAT FHT I AT SO
oreat 3fT 7T o TATT U “IS{Ishe T THTU-I57 H HOTLH FI o o707 U g s |f st feht
STAY AT T AT ATEATT EIIT HT AT [6AT STUAT AT 9157 377 87 T ST |
. oFT T °, MW 34 9, su-fAEw (3) , “Uwer Swfy % U U @Y 9 99T 99§90 T
Sfafad oo orsal % T X “UHe iy % fore o= geie ¥ v &7 goie s 7 srfafvera
[ 9TeR T ST |
. o Faw o, (e 34% ¥, su-fRaw (3) °, “user siwter F forw U WY ¥UT 99T 99T ¥9C AT
AfaTeFT oo eTeat % T UT “UFS Uty % forw g |Y Ta0 quT ot | %9 F it e
9% T ST |
I A, R 1227 ®, 3u-Faw (1) &, 9 (9) ®,-

(i) “T=TH ST TAQ’ &1 o T X &1 ATE T4 gol1< T94” 9168 TE ST,

(ii) TE TG Y FEL TGF H, “TATH T TAC’ QSR Al I T UL, i AT AT, I T T
‘U AT TYW” 968 TG STTA |

.z fRem ¥, w1229 4, s9-fAem (1) ¥, “dag g9 T9” ersal o wTe uY e gRre |5
fafamtor 3 forw smeree & Aree # 4wy g9 T ST fRd g @A g saed & o s
AT €U 967 T STA |

. Sod R °, fRaw 129+ 9 -

#. IU-TFH (1) H, “THTIH ATHIAT 6 TAF F1€ F (o0 &I AT AT TATH AHGT STAL AT I TH A
TTEATT T 9Teal 3T AT o6 T UL T8 AT o T oie  forw & geire safehr
TTAT AT IHF AT AT T 3T TAF (AL F [oIT TaTE ST STAT FT eF” 07
T 37T TG ST,

g, 39-fA=w (5) 7 “ush Gt AT STer reat i AT F T 9T i |1 TR T ores #iY
FEAT TG ST |

[FT. §. Ta.11014/32/2018-31317]
ST, AT o AUSTL, HFd a9



[ 9T [I-Ev€ 3(i)] R T TSI : STHIE 3

feoqur: o= M= sfegE=aT S U%.28-10/45-t= (1), @ 21 e, 1945 gRT A & o0 §
TERTTIT T3 T 9 ST St |erred sTte=mT §eaT 914, 1186 (31), arira 7 fiHaw, 2018 3T
ERIRpIR

MINISTRY OF HEALTH AND FAMILY WELFARE
(Department of Health and Family Welfare

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 12" December, 2018

G.S.R. 1193(E).—Whereas the draft of certain rules further to amend the Drugs and Cosmetics Rules,
1945 was published as required under sections 12 and section 33 of the Drugs and Cosmetics Act, 1940 (23 of
1940), vide notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Health and Family Welfare (Department
of Health and Family Welfare), number G.S.R. 1000(E), dated the 5™ October, 2018 in the Gazette of India,
Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), inviting objections and suggestions from all persons likely to
be affected thereby, before the expiry of a period of fifteen days from the date on which the copies of the
Official Gazette containing the said notification were made available to the public;

And whereas, copies of the Gazette were made available to the public on the 10™ October, 2018;

And whereas, objections and suggestions received from the public on the said rules have been
considered by the Central Government;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 12 and section 33 of the Drugs and
Cosmetics Act, 1940 (23 of 1940), the Central Government, after consultation with the Drugs Technical
Advisory Board, hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Drugs and Cosmetics Rules, 1945,
namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Drugs and Cosmetics (Tenth Amendment) Rules, 2018.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Drugs and Cosmetics Rules, 1945 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in rule 24,-
(a) in sub-rule (1),-

(1) for the words “one thousand rupees for a single drug and an additional fee at the rate of
one hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees for a single drug and an
additional fee at the rate of one thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(i1) in the proviso, for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees”
shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (3), for the words “two hundred and fifty rupees shall be paid”, the words “one
thousand five hundred rupees shall be paid for making amendment in the licence or” shall be
substituted.

3. In the said rules, in rule 24A,-
(a) in sub-rule (3),-

(i) in clause (i), for the words and letters “one thousand and five hundred US dollars”, the
words and letters “ten thousand US dollars” shall be substituted;

(ii) in clause (ii) and proviso thereto, for the words and letters “one thousand US dollars”
wherever they occur, the words and letters “five thousand US dollars” shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (5), for the words and letters “five thousand US dollars”, the words and letters
“twenty five thousand US dollars” shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-rule (7), for the words and letters “three hundred US dollars or its equivalent in
Indian rupees shall be paid”, the words and letters “one thousand eight hundred US dollars



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

or its equivalent in Indian rupees shall be paid for making amendment in the registration
certificate or” shall be substituted.

4. In the said rules, in rule 34, in sub-rule (3), for the words “one hundred rupees for a single drug
and an additional fee of fifty rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees for a single drug and an
additional fee of two thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

S. In the said rules, in rule 34A, in sub-rule (3), for the words “one hundred rupees for a single drug
and an additional fee of fifty rupees”, the words “six hundred rupees for a single drug and an
additional fee of three hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

6. In the said rules, in rule 122A, in sub-rule (1), in clause (b),-

() for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “two lakh fifty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

(i) in the first proviso and in the second proviso, for the words “fifteen thousand rupees”, at
both the places where they occur, the words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

7. In the said rules, in rule 122D, in sub-rule (1), for the words “fifteen thousand rupees”, the words
“fifteen thousand in case of application for manufacture of the fixed dose combinations and one
lakh rupees in case of import application of the fixed dose combinations” shall be substituted..

8. In the said rules, in rule 129A -

(a) in sub-rule (1), for the words and letters, “two hundred and fifty US dollars or its equivalent
to Indian rupees for each brand of cosmetic”, the words and letters “two thousand US dollars
or its equivalent to Indian rupees for each brand of cosmetic and a fee of fifty US dollars for
each variant” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (5), for the words and letters “one hundred US dollars”, the words and letters
“five hundred US dollars” shall be substituted.

[F. No. X.11014/32/2018-DR]
Dr. MANDEEP K BHANDARI, Jt. Secy.

Note: The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India vide notification number F.28-10/45-H(1),
dated the 21* December, 1945 and last amended vide notification number G.S.R. 1186(E), dated the
7™ December, 2018.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. A L O K Digitally signed
by ALOK KUMAR

Date: 2018.12.17
KU MA 15:40:04 +05'30'



